BID 2018-01 Multiple Facility Repairs/Replacement- Hurricane Irma

Plumb Level Rapid Response

Dugard Construction O'neal Roofing Construction KBT Construction Team
1a) Community Development Office- Hurricane Irma
Damaged Areas No Bid $500.00 No Bid $9,000.00 No Bid
1b) Community Development Office- Complete Roof
Replacement with 30-year architectural shingle No Bid $11,942.00 $11,200.00 $15,600.00 $21,070.16
1c) Community Development Office- Complete Roof
Replacement with 26 gauge galvalume No Bid $14,140.00 $10,900.00 $29,200.00 $38,951.78
2a) Animal Control- Hurricane Irma Damaged Areas No Bid $500.00 No Bid $10,000.00 No Bid
2b) Animal Control- Complete Roof Replacement
with 30-year architectural shingle No Bid $14,791.00 $14,100.00 $16,800.00 $15,756.34
2c¢) Animal Control- Complete Roof Replacement
with 26 gauge galvalume $22,400.00 $18,221.00 $13,750.00 $31,600.00 $31,261.02
3a) Sanderson Community Center- Hurricane Irma
Damaged Areas No Bid $2,000.00 No Bid $10,000.00 No Bid
3b) Sanderson Community Center- Complete Roof
Replacement with 30-year architectural shingle No Bid $17,141.00 $12,640.00 $17,200.00 $14,196.20
3c) Sanderson Community Center- Complete Roof
Replacement with 26 gauge galvalume No Bid $17,643.00 $12,300.00 $32,400.00 $26,693.25
4a) Sanderson Fire Station- Hurricane Irma Damaged
Areas No Bid $500.00 No Bid $8,000.00 No Bid
4b) Sanderson Fire Station- Complete Roof
Replacement with 30-year architectural shingle No Bid $9,622.00 $8,220.00 $13,400.00 $10,569.45
4c) Sanderson Fire Station- Complete Roof
Replacement with 26 gauge galvalume No Bid $11,201.00 $8,000.00 $24,400.00 $20,157.56
5a) County Administration Office - Complete Roof
Replacement with PBR Metal Panel No Bid $29,797.00 $20,750.00 $36,500.00 $39,849.37
Unit Cost: Removal and Replacement of any rotten
roof decking (4'x8' sheet) per sheet $100.00 $100.00 $75.00 $250.00 $75.00

Unit Cost: Remove and replace gutter and
downspout per linear foot $20.00 $12.00 $10.00 $8.50 $7.00




