



BAKER COUNTY, FLORIDA

BID RESULTS

Bid #: N/A

Bid Name: Vehicle Maintenance and Repair of EMS transport trucks and Fleet Services

Bid Opening Time: 3:00pm

Bid Opening Date: October 31, 2016

		Fraser's Engine Repair	Murray Ford of Starke	Coggin Ford
		Glen St. Mary	Starke	Jacksonville
Item	AUTOMOBILES			
1	Oil change, filter replacement with fluid check	59.99+ tax+ 5.00ss	29.95	39.95
2	Chassis lube service with fluid check	N/A included in LOF	0	no charge
3	Transmission fluid and filter change service	139.99 and up	229.95	179.95
4	Bulb and fuse replacement	39.95 + parts + up	19.95	39.95
5	Wiper blade replacement	15.00 + part	29.95	29.95
6	Coolant flushes and refills	169.99	109.95	129.95
7	Air conditioning systems check up	40.00	89.95	89.95
Item	LIGHT TRUCKS & SUV'S			
1	Oil change, filter replacement with fluid check	59.99+ TAX+ 5.00	34.95	39.95
2	Chassis lube service with fluid check	N/A included in LOF	0	no charge
3	Transmission fluid and filter change service	139.99 + up	no bid	179.95
4	Bulb and fuse replacement	39.95 + parts + up	no bid	39.95
5	Wiper blade replacement	15.00 + parts	no bid	29.95
6	Coolant flushes and refills	169.99	no bid	129.95
7	Air conditioning systems check up	40.00	no bid	89.95
Item	HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS			
1	Oil change, filter replacement with fluid check	no bid	129.95	105.00
2	Chassis lube service with fluid check	no bid	0	no charge
3	Transmission fluid and filter change service	no bid	229.95	179.95
4	Bulb and fuse replacement	no bid	19.95	39.95
5	Wiper blade replacement	no bid	29.95	29.95
6	Coolant flushes and refills	no bid	139.95	129.95
7	Air conditioning systems check up	no bid	89.95	89.95
Item	EMS TRANSPORT TRUCKS			
1	Oil change, filter replacement with fluid check	no bid	129.95	149.95
2	Chassis lube service with fluid check	no bid	0	no charge
3	Transmission fluid and filter change service	no bid	229.95	179.95
4	Bulb and fuse replacement	no bid	19.95	Demand
5	Wiper blade replacement	no bid	29.95	Demand
6	Coolant flushes and refills	no bid	139.95	199.95
7	Air conditioning systems check up	no bid	89.95	109.95
Item	ALL VEHICLES AND NON-ROUTINE REPAIR SERVICES			
1	Safety Inspection	99	no bid	no charge
2	Annual vehicle inspection	99	no bid	111.16
3	Non-Routine Mechanical repairs (hourly rate)	80	no bid	111.16
4	Provide discount rate on repair parts for non-routine repairs. Discounted from bidder printed parts price	"Don't understand"	no bid	25%

Recommendation for Award/ Signature:
